
Neuroticism Treatment Guidelines

Disclaimer: There is currently no official treatment guideline specifically for neuroticism as a 
standalone condition. Neuroticism is recognized as a personality trait rather than a mental health 
disorder, which complicates the establishment of formal treatment protocols.

Introduction
According to Widiger & Oltmanns (2017), neuroticism is a personality trait characterized by the 
tendency to experience negative emotions like anxiety, anger, irritability, and depression. 

These neurotic tendencies can lead to neurotic behaviors such as obsessive thoughts, emotional 
instability, and excessive worry. Neuroticism is a personality trait that is well-researched and is known 
to be stable over time, often developing early in life.

Treatment options

Cognitive behavioral therapy (CBT)

CBT is an evidence-based form of therapy that helps patients with neurotic behaviors identify and 
change negative thought patterns. This type of therapy is highly effective for treating anxiety disorders, 
depressive disorders, and other mental health conditions that may coexist with neuroticism.

Acceptance and commitment therapy (ACT)

ACT is a mindfulness-based therapy that encourages patients to accept their emotions rather than 
avoid them. It focuses on helping individuals commit to behavioral changes based on their values while 
developing psychological flexibility. This approach helps patients manage negative emotions and 
decrease emotional avoidance, which is common in individuals with neurotic tendencies.

Dialectical behavior therapy (DBT)

DBT is particularly effective for patients who struggle with emotional instability and impulsive 
behaviors. Originally developed for borderline personality disorder, it teaches skills in distress 
tolerance, emotional regulation, and interpersonal effectiveness.

Exposure therapy

Exposure therapy is often used to treat anxiety disorders and is an effective way to address the 
avoidant behaviors seen in individuals with high levels of neuroticism. By gradually exposing patients 
to the sources of their anxiety in a controlled manner, they can learn to manage their fears and 
anxieties, ultimately reducing their neurotic reactions.

Selective serotonin reuptake inhibitors (SSRIs)

SSRIs are commonly prescribed to treat anxiety and depressive disorders, which are often linked to 
high neuroticism. These medications help regulate mood by increasing serotonin levels in the brain, 
reducing symptoms of depression and anxiety, and improving emotional stability.



Mindfulness-based interventions

Mindfulness practices help individuals become more aware of their emotions and reactions, fostering a 
non-judgmental acceptance of their feelings. These interventions, which include mindfulness 
meditation and mindfulness-based stress reduction (MBSR), are particularly effective for managing the 
emotional reactivity and rumination seen in neurotic personalities.

Additional considerations for managing neuroticism

Lifestyle modifications

Encouraging patients to engage in regular physical activity, maintain a balanced diet, and prioritize 
sleep can improve overall mental health and help manage the physical symptoms that often 
accompany neuroticism, such as fatigue and tension.

Stress management

Teaching stress-management techniques such as deep breathing exercises, progressive muscle 
relaxation, or journaling can empower patients to manage day-to-day stressors more effectively.

Psychoeducation

Educating patients on the role neuroticism plays in their emotional responses and behaviors can 
increase their awareness of their triggers and motivate them to engage in therapy. Understanding how 
neurotic traits contribute to negative consequences in everyday life is crucial for long-term 
improvement.
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